
Memorandum Date: April 18,2011 
Order Date: May 4, 2011 

TO: 	 Board of Lane County Commissioners 

FROM DEPARTMENT: 	 Public Works, Road Maintenance Division 

PRESENTED BY: 	 Amo Nelson, Road Maintenance Division Manager 

AGENDA ITEM TITLE: 	 ORDER / In the matter of awarding requirement 
contracts to various contractors to establish unit prices 
for Rock Materials needs during the period of 7/1/11 to 
6/30/12, Prospective Contract No. 11/12·M&S·51 

I. MOTION 

THAT THE ATTACHED BOARD ORDER BE ADOPTED AWARDING 
REQUIREMENT CONTRACTS TO VARIOUS CONTRACTORS FOR 
FURNISHING ROCK MATERIALS FOR FISCAL YEAR 2011-2012, AND THAT 
THE CONTRACTS BE EXECUTED IN ACCORDANCE WITH THE BID 
SPECIFICATIONS, AND THAT THE COUNTY ADMINISTRATOR BE 
AUTHORIZED TO SIGN THE CONTRACTS. 

II. DISCUSSION 

A. Background I Analysis 

Rock contracts are for fumishing rock materials to be used in the maintenance of 
County roads, bridge approaches, and shoulder widening during the fiscal year 
2011-2012. 

Rock materials are reapplied to County road shoulders in order to maintain and 
provide a safe traveling surface, and to minimize the breakdown of pavement 
under heavy traffic and inclement weather conditions. 

Rock material requirement contracts are awarded annually to all qualifying bidders, 
thus guaranteeing Lane County the best price for the materials based on the low 
bid and hauling cost 

Contract specifications require Lane County to purchase at least $100.00 of 
materials from each qualifying bidder. These materials are purchased as needed 
during the term of the contract; therefore, a contract dollar amount cannot be 
specified. 

Rock Materials 

Contract No. 11 !12·M&S-51 
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B. Recommendation 


The use of rock materials in road maintenance helps prevent potential safety 

hazards and reduces capital improvement expenditures, 


Recommendation is to award requirement contracts to qualified bidders, 


III. ATTACHMENTS 

Board Order 

Bid Recap 
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IN THE BOARD OF COMMISSIONERS OF LANE COUNTY 

STATE OF OREGON 


ORDER NO. ( In the matter of awarding requirement contracts to 
( various contractors to establish unit prices for 
( Rock Materials needs during fiscal year 2011­
( 2012, prospective Contract No. 11112-M&S-51 

WHEREAS, on April 13, 2011, Arno Nelson, Road Maintenance Division Manager for 
Lane County Department of Public Works, under authority of Lane Manual, Chapter 21 , opened 
bids for Rock Materials, Prospective Contract No. 11 /12-M&S-S1; and 

WHEREAS, bids were submitted by Aggregate Resource Crushing, LLC., fka BJ 
Equipment Company, LLC, dba Bradford Quarry, Coburg Road Quarry, Conser Quarry Co., 
Delta Sand & Gravel, Eugene Sand & Gravel , Eugene Sand & Gravel- Coburg Rd. Location, 
Fisher Land Co., dba Hale Valley Rock Products, Inc., Fisher Land Co., dba Oakridge Sand & 
Gravel, Inc., Hawley Creek Quarry Inc., J Davidson & Sons Construction Co. , Inc. for Henton 
Pit/Camp Creek Road, J Davidson & Sons Construction Co., Inc. for Yard 3/Kitson Springs, 
Knife River Corporation Northwest, Mapleton Rock Products Inc., Martin Creek Quarry, Inc., 
Mid-Valley Gravel Co., M.J. Asphalt & Grading, Portable Rock Production Co., Inc., Precision 
Aggregate Products, and Wild ish Building Material Co., dba Wildish Sand & Gravel Co. , and the 
Director of the Department of Public Works recommends that these bids be accepted; NOW 
THEREFORE BE IT 

ORDERED that the bids received from the afore-mentioned contractors be accepted as 
recommended; and it is further 

ORDERED that the afore-mentioned contractors each be awarded requirement 
contracts for the 2011-2012 fiscal year in accordance with the bid specifications; and it is further 

ORDERED that these requirement contracts be executed in accordance with this' Order 
and the bid specifications, and that the County Administrator be authorized to sign the 
requirement contracts. 

Effective this __ day of ______, 2011 

Faye Steward, Chair 
Lane County Board of Commissioners 

APPROVED AS TO FORM ,. . 
'1" 7;, - / ' Date ,J:. . . Lane County 
,,~.;. /-;;'.?--'"

/ 7 / ,c< ~....;;.. ~>" 
OFFICE OF LEGAL COL'NSEL 



LANE COUNTY DEPARTMENT OF PUBLIC WORKS 

BID RECAP 

Description : ROCK MATERIALS Bid Opening: 10:00 A.M., WEDNESDAY, APRIL 13, 2011 


Contract No.: 11/12-M&S-51 Prepared By: L Clark Checked By: _A-'-'-N_E:c:L:..:S_O--'N______ 


#1 #2 #3 
AGGREGATE RESOURCE COBURG ROAD QUARRY CONSER QUARRY CO. 
CRUSHING, LLC, FKA BJ 90436 COBURG ROAD 27387 FERGUSON RD. 
EQUIPMENT CO. LLC, DBA EUGENE,OR JUNCTION CITY, OR 
BRADFORD QUARRY (541) 484-2000 (541) 998-6493 
4080 COMMERCIAL AVE. 
SPRINGFIELD, OR 
(541) 747-6261 

ITEM ITEM UNIT UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE 
NO. 

1 . 1 1/2" Crushed Rock Open Per Ton 8.75 8.75 7.00 

2. 1 1 12" Round Open Per Ton No Bid No Bid No Bid 

3. 1 1/2"-0" Crushed Per Ton 8.00 7.50 6.50 

4 . 112"-0" Crushed Rock Per Ton 12.00 9.00 1000 

5. 1/4"-No. 10 Sanding Rock Per Ton 15.75 No Bid No Bid 

6. 3" Cru shed Open Per Ton 8.75 8.50 6.25 

7. 3" Round Open Per Ton No Bid No Bid No Bid 

8. 3"-0" Crushed Rock Per Ton 8.00 7.25 6.00 

9. 3/4" Crushed Reject Per Ton 3.25 NoBid 4.00 

10. 3/4" Crushed Rock Open Per Ton 8.75 9.00 7.30 

11. 3/4" Round Open Per Ton No Bid No Bid No Bid 

12. 3/4"-0" Crushed Rock Per Ton 8.00 7.50 6.80 

13. 3/8" Round (Pea Rock) Per Ton No Bid No Bid No Bid 

14. 3/8"-#10 Pre-coated Aggregate PerTon No Bid No Bid No Bid 

15. 3/8"-#10 Un-coated Aggregate Per Ton No Bid No Bid No Bid 

16. 5"-0" Crushed Rock PerTon 8.00 No Bid No Bid 

17. 5"-3" Crushed (Logger Special) Per Ton 9.75 No Bid No Bid 

18. 5"-7" Crushed Rock Open Per Ton 9.75 8.50 No Bid 

19. 6" Crushed Ope~ _ PerTon 9.75 8.50 6.50 
-­ -



---

LANE COUNTY DEPARTMENT OF PUBLIC WORKS 

BID RECAP 


Description: ROCK MATERIALS Bid Opening: 10:00AM., WEDNESDAY, APRIL 13, 2011 


Contract No.: 11112-M&S-S1 Prepared By: l Clark Checked By: _Ac.:..:.Nc.::E:::;L::.;S::.;O::.;N"-_____ 


UNITITEM ITEM 
NO. , 

#1 
AGGREGATE RESOURCE 
CRUSHING, lLC, FKA BJ 
EQUIPMENT CO. LLC, DBA 
BRADFORD QUARRY 
4080 COMMERCIAL AVE 
SPRINGFIELD, OR 
(541)747-6261 

UNIT PRICE 

I 

#2 
COBURG ROAD QUARRY 
90436 COBURG ROAD 
EUGENE,OR 
(541) 484-2000 

UNIT PRICE 

#3 
CONSER QUARRY CO. 
21381 FERGUSON RD. 
JUNCTION CITY, OR 
(541) 998-6493 

UNIT PRICE 

20. . Gablon Rock - 3;;-t~ 12" Ooen . Per Ton 9.75 No Bid Bid 

21,. 6"-0" Crushed -Jaw Run Per Ton i 8.00 	 -7.25--------- 6.00 

2'}'L. I 6"-0" Crushed Rock Per Ton ROO 7.25 I 6.00 

2'- I 6"-3" Crushed Rock Per Ton 9.75 ~o Bid No Bidn __ 	 ___ i 
n n 

24. I Bar Run Per Ton No Bid No Bid No Bid 	 ' 

J.2" I Beach Sand Per Ton No Bld- . No Bid No B~dl 
26 ) Fairway Sand Per Ton No Bid . No Bid No Bid ~ ________ 	 I 

Fill Sand 	 . Per Ton No Bid No Sid No Bid )27 
28. 	U,,-and.,ca Rocki PerT~n 30.00 25.00 1500"1 

I29. Loam 	 Per Ton No Bid No 	 I=-.:::::.:::.. 
30 Machine Selected Rip Rap Per Ton 15.00 

'~I__~~ 

31 I Non:Machine Selected Rip Rap PerTon 11.50 
Portland Cement Concrete - 3500 pSI 

3/4" rock 	 Per Ton No Bid No Bid No Bid 
32 

33. Quarry Run 	 6.75 6.30 5~80 

• DEVIATIONS 	 NIA N/A NIA 

0<)'-'0 ? r,{ 1 ~ 

http:7.25---------6.00


LANE COUNTY DEPARTMENT OF PUBLIC WORKS 

BID RECAP 

Description: ROCK MATERIALS Bid Opening: 10:00 A.M., WEDNESDAY, APRIL 13, 2011 


Con tract No.: 11/12-M&S-51 Prepared By: L Clark Checked By: ....c.A:....N"'E"'L=..S'-O"-'-'N______ 


#4 #5 #6 

IDELTA SAND & GRAVEL EUGENE SAND & GRAVEL EUGENE SAND & GRAVEL 
999 DIVISION AVE 3000 DELT A HWY. N COBURG RD. LOCATION 
EUGENE, OR P.O. BOX 1067 P.O. BOX 1067 
(541) 688-2233 EUGENE, OR EUGENE, OR 

(541) 683-6400 (541) 683-6400 

ITEM ITEM UNIT UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE 
INO. 

1 . 1 1/2"" Crushed Rock Open Perlon 7.90 8.00 8.00 I 
2 . 1 1/2"" Round Open Per Ton 640 7.00 I 7.50 

3. 1 1/2"-0" Crushed Per Ton 6.60 600 ! 6.00 !, 
4. 1/2"-0" Crushed Rock Per Ton 9.10 No Bid 7.00 

, 
I 

5. 1/4"-No. 1 0 Sanding Rock Per Ton No Bid No Bid 11.00, 

6. 3" Crushed Open PerTon No Bid No Bid 8.00 

7. 3" Round Open Per Ton NoBid No Bid 22.00 

8. 3"-0" Crushed Rock PerTon No Bid No Bid 6.50 

9. 3/4" Crushed Reject Per Ton No Bid No Bid 4.75 

10. 3/4" Crushed Rock Open Per Ton 7.90 No Bid 8.50 
-, 

11 . 3/4" Ro und Open PerTon No Bid 6.00 8.50 , 
12 3/4"-0" Crushed Rock PerTon 6.80 6.00 6.00 

13. 3/8" Round (Pea Rock) Perlan 6.10 600 5.75 I 

14. 3/8"-#10 Pre-coated Aggregate Per Ton No Bid No Bid No Bid 

15. 318"-#10 Un-coated Aggregate PerTon No Bid No Bid No Bid 

16. 5"-0" Crushed Rock Per Ton No Bid No Bid No Bid 

17. 5"-3" Crushed (Logger Special) Per Ton No Bid No Bid No Bid 

18 5"-7" Crushed Rock Open PerTon No Bid No Bid No Bid 

19. 6" Crushed Open Per Ton No Bid No Bid No Bid 
-



LANE COUNTY DEPARTMENT OF PUBLIC WORKS 

BID RECAP 

Description: ROCK MATERIALS Bid Opening: 10:00 AM., WEDNESDAY, APRIL 13, 2011 


Contract No.: 11/12·M&S·51 Prepared By: L Clark Checked By: -'....A:.cN..:.E-=LS.:....:.O..:.N'--_____ 


#4 #5 #6 
DELTA SAND & GRAVEL EUGENE SAND & GRAVEL EUGENE SAND & GRAVEL 
999 DIVISION AVE 3000 DELTA HWY. N COBURG RD. LOCATION 
EUGENE, OR P.O. BOX 1067 P.O. BOX 1067 
(541) 688·2233 EUGENE, OR EUGENE, OR I 

(541) 683·6400 (541) 683·6400 
ITEM 
NO. ITEM UNIT UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRlC" 

20. Gabion Rock ­ 3" to 12" Open Per Ton No Bid No Bid No Bid 

21. 6"·0" Crushed ·Jaw Run Per Ton No Bid No Bid No Bid 

22. 6"·0" Crushed Rock Per Ton No Bid No Bid No Bid 

23. 6"·3" Crushed Rock PerTon No Bid No Bid No Bid 

24. Bar Run Per Ton 5.00 No Bid 5.50 

25. Beach Sand Per Ton 16.90 16.00 16.00 

26. Fairway Sand Per Ton No Bid 16.00 16.00 

27. Fill Sand Per Ton 5.40 5.00 5.00 

28. Landscape Rock PerTon No Bid No Bid 32.00 

29. Loam Per Ton No Bid 7.50 7.50 

30. Machine Selected Rip Rap Per Ton No Bid No Bid No Bid 

31. Non·Machine Selected Rip Rap Per Ton No Bid No Bid No Bid 

32. Portland Cement Concrete· 3500 psi No Bid 
3/4" rock Per Ton No Bid 90.00 CY 

33. Quarry Pit Run PerTon 4.00 No Bid No Bid 
• DEVIATIONS N/A N/A N/A 
ADDENDUMS Ilel11 #6, 3" Crushed Open: Eugene 

Item #26 - Fairway Sand: 
Sand & Gravel requests acceptance 
of our 1" ­ 3" Crushed Open 

Eugene Sand & Gravel submits Aggregate. 

our green sand for this item. Item #7. 3" Round Open: Eugene 

N/A This material is screened and Sand & Gravel requests acceptance 
of our 1" -3~ Round Open 

washed at our North Pit Aggregate. 
location. This material is not !tem #9. Y-," Crushed Reject: Eugene 

Columbia River sand. Sand &Gravel requests acceptance 
of our 3" Reject Aggregate 
Item #26. FaifV.Iay Sand: Euqene I 
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LANE COUNTY DEPARTMENT OF PUBLIC WORKS 

BID RECAP 

Description : ROCK MATERIALS Bid Opening: 10:00 A.M., WEDNESDAY, APRIL 13, 2011 


Contract No.: 11/12-M&S-51 Prepared By: L Clark Checked By: _A'-'-'.N.:..;E:..:L:..:S::...O::...N"--_____ 


Sand & Gravel requests acceptance 
of our Green Sand. This material is 
produced a t our Coburg Rd 
location. This is nol Columbia River 
Sand . 
Eugene Sand & Gravel req uests an 
additiona l product to the materia ls 
list. 
Item 1134 ~ .. - O~ Minus - $6 50 per 
Ion 
Item #35 T rench Blend (Backfill I 

-

Material) Fill Sand I W' Round 
Blended IOQether. S5.00 per Ion I 
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LANE COUNTY DEPARTMENT OF PUBLIC WORKS 

810 RECAP 

Description: ROCK MATERlAlS Bid Opening: 10:00 AM., WEDNESDAY, APRil 13, 2011 

Contract No.: 11112·M&S·51 Prepared By: l Clark Checked A NELSON 

#7 #8 #9 
FISHER LAND CO. DBA, HALE FISHER LAND CO., DBA HAWLEY CREEK QUARRY. 
VALLEY ROCK PRODUCTS OAKRIDGE SAND & GRAVEL INC. 

i P.O. BOX 751 P.O. BOX 751 P.O. BOX 1000 
OAKRIDGE. OR OAKRIDGE, OR COTTAGE GROVE, OR 

(5411 782.2201 (541) (541) 942-1057 
.. 

ITEM ITEM UNIT UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE 
NO. 

1. 1 112" Crushed Rock Open Per Ton 8.00 8.00 No Bid 

2. 1 112" Round Open Per Ton No Bid 9.00 No Bid 

3. 1 1/2"·0" Crushed Per Ton 8.20 7.20 7.45 

4. 1/2"·0" Crushed Rock Per Ton NoBid 10.25 No Bid 

5. 1/4"·No. 10 SandinCl Rock Per Ton NoBid 12.50 No 

3" C, ,~h",rl Open NoBia No-Bid 
.... 

6. Per Ton 7.75 

7. 3" Round Open Per Ton No Bid No Bid NoE3i(l 
. ... 

8. 3"-0" Crushed Rock Per Ton 7.80 6.80 7.25 .... 

9 3/4" Crushed Bejeci Per Ton i No Bid 600 No-Sid 

10. I 3/4" Crushed Rock Open Per Ton No Bid 8.50 NO Bid 
- - - --------------­ .... 

11 3/4" Round Open Per Ton No Bid 900 No Bid 

12. 3/4"-0" Crushed Rock Per Ton 8.20 7.20 I 7.45 
13. 3/8" Round (Pea Rock) Per Ton No Bid 8.25 No Bid 

14. 3/8"-#10 Pre-coated Aggregate PerTon No Bid No Bid No Bid 

15. 3/8"-#10 Un-coated Aggregate No Bid No Bid c---
NoElidPerTon 

16. 5"-0" Crushed Rock PerTon No Bid No Bid 7.00 

17. 5"·3" Crushed (Logger Special) PerTon 8.50 7.50 7.00 

l 18. 5"·7" Crushed Rock Open j Per Ton No Bid No Bid 8.00 
.... 

19. 6" Crushed Open Per Ton 8.50 No Bid 8.00 
- - ---------------­ - - - --------------­ .... 

P"np I') nf 11') 



LANE COUNTY DEPARTMENT OF PUBLIC WORKS 

BID RECAP 

Description : ROCK MATERIALS Bid Opening: 10:00 A.M., WEDNESDAY, APRIL 13, 2011 


Contract No. : 11 /12-M&S-51 Prepared By: L Clark Checked By: ---'.CAc:N.cE=LS=-=0.cN=---_____ 


#7 #8 #9 
FISHER LAND CO. DBA, HALE FISHER LAND CO., DBA HAWLEY CREEK QUARRY. 
VALLEY ROCK PRODUCTS OAKRIDGE SAND & GRAVEL INC. 

• P.O. BOX 751 P.O. BOX 751 P.O. BOX 1000 
OAKRIDGE, OR OAKRIDGE, OR COTIAGE GROVE, OR 
(541) 782-2201 (541) 782-2201 (541) 942-1057 

ITEM ITEM UNIT UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE 
NO. 

20 . Gabion Rock ­ 3" to 12" Open Per Ton No Bid No Bid No Bid 

2 1 . 6 "-0" C rushed - Jaw R un Per Ton 6.80 No Bid 7.00 

22 6"-0" Crushed R ock Per Ton No Bid No Bid 7.00 

23. 6"-3" C rus hed Rock Per Ton No Bid No Bid 7 00 

2 4 . Ba r Run Per Ton No Bid 5.50 No Bid 

25. Beach Sand Per Ton No Bid No Bid No Bid 

26 . Fa irway Sand PerTon No Bid No Bid No Bid 

2 7 . Fill Sand Per Ton No Bid 8.00 No Bid 

28 . Landscape R ock PerTon No Bid 40.00 1900 I 
29 . Loam PerTon No Bid No Bid No Bid 

30 . Machine Selected Rip Rap Per Ton 15.00 No Bid 11 .00 

3 1. Non-Ma chine Selected Rip Rap Per Ton No Bid No Bid 6.50 
32. Po rtl and Cement Concrete ­ 3500 psi No Bid No Bid 

y."' rock PerTon No Bid 

33. Quarry Pit Run Per Ton 6.20 No Bid 5.60 

• DEVIATIONS N/A N/A 
#34 Gabion Rock 6" - 12" 

Crushed Rock $8.00 per ton 

ADDENDUMS N/A N/A N/A 

-

http:CAc:N.cE=LS=-=0.cN


LANE COUNTY DEPARTMENT OF PUBLIC WORKS 

BID RECAP 

Description: ROCK MATERIALS Bid Opening: 10:00 A.M., WEDNESDAY, APRIL 13, 2011 


Contract No.: 11112-M&S-51 Prepared By: L Clark Checked By: ~A~N~E==L~S~O~N~___________ 


. I 1 #10 #11 #12 
i J. DAVlDSON & SONS CaNST. J. DAVlDSON & SONS CaNST. KNIFE RIVER CORP ­ NW 
! P.O. BOX 1018 P.O. BOX 1018 32260 OLD HIGHWAY 34 
i OAKRIDGE, OR OAKRIDGE, OR TANGENT, OR 
I HENTON PIT/CAMP CREEK RD YARD 31K1TSON SPRINGS (541) 928-6491 
j(S41l782-4122 (541)782-4122 

--------------­

UNIT I 
I 

ITEM ITEM UNIT PRICE 
I 

UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE 
NO. 

1. 1 %" Crushed Rock Open Per Ton I 9.45 945 7.85 

2. 1 y,' Round Open Per Ton No Bid No Bid No Bid I 

f-- 3. 1 %"-0" Crushed Per Ton 6.97 7.61 7.35 1 
! 4. ;/,"-0" Crushed Rock PerTon 8.93 No Bid No Bid ---11­ --------'-'-­

Y.\"-No. 1 0 Sanding Rock No Bid 
! 5. Per Ton No Bid 14.50 
r 

6. 3" Crushed Open I Per Ton 9.45 No Bid 8.10 I 
7. 3" Round Open Per Ton No Bid No Bid No Bid 

18. 3"-0" Crushed Rock i PerTon 6.78 7.35 6.85 

9. '%" Crushed Reject i PerTon No Bid No Bid 5.50 

10. '%" Crushed Rock Open Per Ton 9.45 No Bid 7.85 i 
11. 

--------------­
'%" Round Open PerTon • No Bid No Bid No Bid J 

12. W'-O" Crushed Rock Per Ton •7.21 7.88 745 
, 

13 3/8" Round (Pea Rock) Per Ton I No Bid No Bid No Bid 

14. 3/8"-#10 Pre-coated Aggregate Per Ton i No Bid No Bid No Bid 
I 

15. 3/8"-#10 Un-coated Aggregate Per Ton i No Bid I No Bid No Bid , 
I, 

16. 5"-0" Crushed Rock I Per Ton 6.78 No Bid 8.35 Yo" Crushed Rock 

17. 5"-3" Crushed (Logqer Special) PerTon 6.78 No Bid ! 
No Bid I 

18. 5"-7" Crushed Rock Open PerTon 9.45 No Bid 8.10 I 
19. 6" Crushed Open PerTon 9.45 No Bid No Bid I 

I i 

P;,,,p R nf 1 h 



, 

LANE COUNTY DEPARTMENT OF PUBLIC WORKS 

BID RECAP 

Description: ROCK MATERIALS Bid Opening: 10:00 A.M., WEDNESDAY, APRIL 13, 2011 


Contract No.: 11/12-M&S-51 Prepared By: L Clark Checked By: _A_N_E_L_S_O_N______ 


#10 #11 #12 
1J. DAVIDSON & SONS CONST. J . DAVIDSON & SONS CONST. KNIFE RIVER CORP ­ NW 

P.O. BOX 1018 P.O. BOX 1018 32260 OLD HIGHWAY 34 I 
OAKRIDGE, OR OAKRIDGE, OR TANGENT, OR I 
HENTON PIT/CAMP CREEK RD YARD 3/K1TSON SPRINGS (541) 928·6491 
(541) 782-4122 (541) 782-4122 

ITEM ITEM UNIT UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE I 

NO. ; 

20. Gabion Rock ­ 3" to 12" Open Per Ton No Bid No Bid 12.00 I 
21 . 6"-0" Crushed -Jaw Run Per Ton 6.78 No Bid 6.10 

22. 6"-0" Cru shed Rock Per Ton 6.78 No Bid 6.85 ; 

23. 6"-3" C rushed Rock PerTon 9.45 No Bid No Bid i 
24, Bar Run PerTon No Bid 6,30 No Bid I 

25 , Beach Sand PerTon No Bid No Bid No Bid 
, 

I 
26. Fairway Sand Per Ton No Bid No Bid No Bid , 
27 . Fill Sand PerTon No Bid No Bid 985 I 
28 , Landscape Rock PerTon 23.00 No Bid 30.00 J 
29. Loam Per Ton NoBid No Bid No Bid : 
30. Machine Selected Rip Rap PerTon 12.60 No Bid 18.25 ,, 

10.50 No Bid I31, Non-Machine Selected Rip Rap Per Ton 11.75 
32. Portland Cement Concrete ­ 3500 psi PerTon No Bid No Bid 

Yo" rock No Bid 

33. Quarry Pit Run PerTon 6.09 9.45 5,85 
Item #8. Yo" - #10 Sanding 

iN/A N/A Rock available at Eugene 
Plant only, 1001 Division 

• DEVIATIONS Ave. 

ADDENDUMS N/A N/A N/A 

i 



__ 

LANE COUNTY DEPARTMENT OF PUBLIC WORKS 

BID RECAP 

Description: ROCK MATERIALS ~dO~~~ W11 

Contract No.: 11112-M&S-51 Prepared By: l Clark Checked By: A NELSON 

i #13 #14 #15 
MAPLETON ROCK PRODUCTS, MARTIN CREEK QUARRY, INC. MID-VALLEY GRAVEL CO. 
INC. P.O. BOX 1000 P.O. BOX 1089 
P.O. BOX 63 COTTAGE GROVE, OR PHILOMATH, OR 

IMAPLETON, OR (541) 942-1057 (541) 929-2200 
(541) 268-0300 ! 

- - ---------­

ITEM ITEM UNIT UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE 
NO. 
~...... 

.. ; 1/2" Crushed Rock Open 8.45 No Bid 1. Per Ton 10.80 (Deviation) 
. ........ 

2. ..11/2" Round Open i Per Ton No Bid No Bid No 
C----' ..... 

7.45 7.50 
......... 

3. 1 1/2"-0" Crushed PerTon 10.60 . 

11.80 (Deviation) 8.45 
i 4. 1/2"-0" Crushed Rock Per Ton No Bid 

5. .V4"-No. 10 Sanding Rock Per Ton 20,80 (Deviation) No Bid No Bid c---­ ..... 
8.25 8.25 

........­
6. 3" Crushed Open Per Ton 10.80 (Deviation) 

7. 3"Round Open Per Ton No Bid No Bid ! No Bid 
- ----------­ I 

8. 3"-0" Crushed Rock Per Ton 10,40 7.25 7.00 

9. 3/4" Crushed Reject Per Ton No Bid No Bid No Bid 

10: 3/4" I:n ,,,h,,ri Rock Open Per Ton 11.80 (Deviation) 845 No Bid 
j... 

No Bid No Bid 11 . 3/4" Round Open Per Ton NaBld 

12. 3/4"-0" Crushed Rock Per Tor> 10.60 7.45 i 7.50 ! 
13. 3/8" Round (Pea Rock) Per Ton NaBld NaBld NaBid 

.. 

14. ! 3/8"·#10 Pre-ccaled Aggregate Per Ton No Bid NoBid No Bid 

15. 3/8"-#10 l" Aggregate Per Ton 16.80 (Deviation) No Bid No Bid 

16. < 5"-0" Crushed Rock PerTon 10.80 (Deviation) 7.00 Na Bid 

l:fIHc~:~:~;~;;:c -'~ 
10,80 (Deviation) 

.. 

No Bid PerTon 7.00 

Per Ton i m80 (Deviation) 
.. 

8,00 No Bid 
! 

ParTon 10,80 (Deviation) 8.00 1 NaBid I 

P';lnp 1 n,..,f '1;::: 



LANE COUNTY DEPARTMENT OF PUBLIC WORKS 

BID RECAP 

Descri ption : ROCK MATERIALS Bid Opening: 10:00 AM., WEDNESDAY, APRIL 13, 2011 


Contract No. : 1111 2-M&S-51 Prepared By: L Clark Checked By : -'-A_N"'E"'L.:..S:...O:...N"-_____ 


#15 #13 #14 
MAPLETON ROCK PRODUCTS. MARTIN CREEK QUARRY. INC. MID·VALLEY GRAVEL CO.I ! 

P.O. BOX 1000 P.O. BOX 1089INC. 
P.O. BOX 63 COTTAGE GROVE, OR PHILOMA TH. OR 
MAPLETON, OR (541) 942-1057 I (541 ) 929-2200 ! 
(541 ) 268-0300 i 

! ,UNIT PRICE UNIT PRI CE UNIT PRI CE ITEM UNITITEM 
NO. 

,
No Bid No Bid Per Ton20. Gabion Rock - 3" to 12" Open 13.00 (Deviation) : 

7.00 : No Bid 6"-0" Crushed -Jaw Run Per Ton 21 . 9.20 

22 . 6"-0 " Crushed Rock PerTon 10.60 (Deviation) 7.00 , No Bid 
7.00 8.25 (see devi at ion)10.80 (Deviation)6"-3" Crushed Rock PerTon23. ! 

No Bid No Bid No Bid 24. Bar Run PerTon 
No Bid !No Bid No Bid 25. Beach Sand Per Ton 
No Bid No Bid No Bid 26. Fa irway Sa nd PerTon : 

No Bid No Bid No Bid 27. Fill Sa nd PerTon 
I 

iNo Bid 19.00 25.00 28 . Landscape Rock PerTon I 
No Bid No Bid No Bid 29. Loam Per Ton 

11 .00 30. Machi ne Se lected Rip Ra p Per Ton 12.00 and up, Deviation 20.50 
6.50 31 . Non-Machine Selected R ip Rap Per Ton No Bid 15.50 (see deviation) 

Per Ton No Bid 32 . No Bid 
3/4" rock 
Portland Cement Concrete - 3500 psi 

No Bid i 
No Bid 5.60 Per Ton 7.00 

Products with deviation nolation are 
33. Q uarry Pit Run 

Item #23. Our product is 
special run products and require one approximately 6~ - 3" c rushed open • DEVIATIONS 

rock . ( 1) month notice for availabilit y. I,Gabion Rock $8.00 per ton Item #3 , . Our product is non-select 
we~ notice. 
Machine select rip rap requires one 

6" - 12" Crushed Rock and non-sorted rip rap. J,
These are prices for products that 
we usually stock at our quarry at th e 

N/A ADDENDUMS east end of Coleman Rd. in the Ml 
N/A Tom/Coburo area . All oroducts may 

Paoe 11 of 16 



LANE COUNTY DEPARTMENT OF PUBLIC WORKS 

BID RECAP 

Description: ROCK MATERIALS Bid Opening: 10:00 A.M., WEDNESDAY, APRIL 13, 2011 

Contract No.: 11/12-M&S-51 Prepared By: L Clark Checked By: _A'-'-'-N.c:E:..:L:..:S'-0::cN-=---_____ 

not be available at all limes. On-site 
represenlative is Larry McMahan 
541-602-0567 

P"np 1? nf 1(; 



LANE COUNTY DEPARTMENT OF PUBLIC WORKS 

BID RECAP 

Description : ROCK MATERIALS Bid Opening: 10:00 AM., WEDNESDAY, APRIL 13, 2011 


Contract No.: 11/12·M&S·51 Prepared By: L Clark Checked By: ....:,:Ac;,N.:.:E;::L;::S:.:O::,N:.:...._____ 


#16 #17 #18 

M.J. ASPHALT & GRADING PORTABLE ROCK PRECISION AGGREGATE 
49259 MCKENZIE HWY. PRODUCTION CO., INC. PRODUCTS, INC. 
VIDA, OR P.O. BOX 465 95700 TERRITORIAL HWY 
(541) 822·6017 PLEASANT HILL, OR MONROE, OR 

(5411747·0790 (541) 998·8615 

ITEM ITEM UNIT UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE 
NO. 

, 

1 . 1 y," Crushed Rock Open Per Ton No Bid No Bid 7.15 

2. 1 y," Round Open Per Ton No Bid No Bid No Bid 

3. 1 y,"·O" Cru shed Per Ton 9.50 7.24 6.25 

4 . ;;,"·0" Cru shed Rock Per Ton No Bid No Bid 10.65 

5 . Y. "·No . 1 0 Sanding Rock Per Ton No Bid No Bid 12.65 

6 3" Crushed Open PerTon No Bid No Bid 6.25 

7. 3" Round Open Per Ton No Bid No Bid No Bid 

8. 3"·0 " Crushed Rock Per Ton 9.50 7.05 5.75 

9 Yo " Crushed Reject Per Ton 5. 00 No Bid No Bid I 
10. Yo" Cru shed Rock Open Per Ton 9.50 No Bid 7.65 
11 . Yo" Round Open Per Ton No Bid No Bid No Bid 
12 . YO"·O" Cru shed Rock Per Ton 9.50 7.43 6.45 
13. 3/8" Ro und (Pea Rock) Per Ton No Bid No Bid No Bid 

14. 3/8"·#1 0 Pre·coa ted Aggregate Per Ton No Bid No Bid No Bid 

15. 3/8"·#10 Un·coa ted Aggregate PerTon No Bid No Bid No Bid 

16 . 5"·0" Crushed Rock PerTon No Bid No Bid 5.75 

17. 5"·3" Crushed (Logger Special ) Per Ton No Bid No Bid 6.25 

18 . 5"· ?" Crushed Rock Open PerTon No Bid No Bid 6.25 

19. 6" C rushed Open Per Ton No Bid No Bid 5.50 



-------------------

LANE COUNTY DEPARTMENT OF PUBLIC WORKS 

BID RECAP 


Description: ROCK MATERIALS Bid Opening: 10:00 A.M., WEDNESDAY, APRIL 13, 2011 

Contract No.: 11/12-M&S-51 P"'Dared By: L Clark Checked By: A NELSON 

#16 #17 #18 

iili:J.ASPHALT /I. GRADING PORTABLE ROCK--­ PI>~1 \Ie: 
49259 MCKENZIE HWY. PRODUCTION CO., lNC. PRODUCTS, INC. 
VIDA,OR P.O.60X465 95700 TERRITORIAL HWY 
(541 ) 822-6017 PLEASANT HILL, OR MONROE, OR 

(541) 741-0790 (541) 998-8615 
ITEM . ITEM UNIT j UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE 
NO. 

--­
20 Gablon Rock ­ T to 12" Open I PerTon No Bid No Bid 10.65 

21. 6"-0" Crushed -Jaw Run Per Ton 9.50 6.11 5.75 

22 6"-0" Crushed Rock Per Ton No Bid No Bid 5.75 
- - - - ------------------ ­

23. 6"-3" Crushed Rock Per Ton No Bid 6.30 6.25 

24 Bar Run PerTon No Bid No Bid No Bid 

25. Beach Sand PerTon No Bid No Bid No Bid 
- - ------------------ ­

26. Fairway Sand Per Ton No Bid No Bid No Bid 

27. Fill Sand I Per Ton No Bid No Bid No Bid 

28 I Rock I PerTon 1ROO No Bid 55.50 
- - - - ------------------ ­

29. Loam Per Ton No Bid No Bid No Bid 

30. Machine Selected Rip Rap Per Ton 20.00 No Bid 14.65 
31. Non-Machine SelectedRifl Rap Per Ton 18.00 No Bid 11 65 

v' '"'' 'U Cement Concrete - 3500 psi I No Bid No Bid 

!32 3/4' rock _____ Pet Ton. No Bid 
33. Quarry Pi! Run Per Ton! 9.50 5.51 5.50 

• DEVIATIONS N/A N/A N/A 
1. Insurance Binder .. If Iput the 

you want it will cost me 
$1000jJOoer vear more and vou're 

I 

NIA 
ADDENDUMS Free dean dirtlnll dump! 

do it by the 
3. lf you a different kind of spec 

and we don't have it we will 

P"nF' 14 nf 1 h 



LANE COUNTY DEPARTMENT OF PUBLIC WORKS 

BID RECAP 

Description: ROCK MATERIALS Bid Opening: 10:00 AM., WEDNESDAY, APRIL 13, 2011 


Contract No.: 11/12-M&S-51 Prepared By: L Clark Checked By: _A--'.N'-'E:..:L:..:S'-O:..:N..:...._____ 


#19 #20 #21 

WILDISH BUILDING 
MATERIALS CO. DBA, 
W1LDISH SAND & GRAVEL CO. 
P.O. BOX 7428 
EUGENE, OR (541)485-1700 

ITEM 
NO. ITEM UNIT UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE 

1. 1 y," Crushed Rock Open Per Ton No Bid 

2. 1 y," Round Open Per Ton No Bid 

3. 1 W'-O" Crushed Per Ton 6.50 

4. y,"-O" Crushed Rock Per Ton No Bid 

5. Y-,"-No. 1 0 Sanding Rock PerTon 14.05 

6. 3" Crushed Open Per Ton No Bid 

7. 3" Round Open Per Ton No Bid 

8. 3"-0" Crushed Rock PerTon No Bid 

9. 0/." Crushed Reject PerTon No Bid I 
10. 0/." Crushed Rock Open PerTon 10.75 

11 . 0/." Round Open PerTon 10.75 

12. 0/."-0" Crushed Rock PerTon 6.50 

13. 3/8" Round (Pea Rock) Per Ton No Bid 

14. 3/8"-#10 Pre-coated A~~re~ate Per Ton 29.10 

15. 3/8"-#10 Un-coated Aggregate PerTon 14.50 

16. 5"-0" Crushed Rock PerTon No Bid 

17. 5"-3" Crushed (Logger Special) PerTon No Bid 

18. 5"-7" Crushed Rock Open Per Ton No Bid 

19. 6" Crushed Open PerTon No Bid 
-­



LANE COUNTY DEPARTMENT OF PUBLIC WORKS 

BID RECAP 

Description: ROCK MATERIALS Bid Opening: 10:00 A.M., WEDNESDAY, APRil 13, 2011 


Contract No.: 11f12-M&S-51 Prepared By: L Clark Ch ecked By: --'A--'-.:-N"'Ec.:L'-'S'--Oc.:N-'-_____ 


#19 #20 #21 

WILDISH BUILDING 

J 
MATERIALS CO. DBA, 
WILDISH SAND & GRAVEL CO. 
P.O. BOX 7428 
EUGENE, OR (541) 485-1700 

ITEM ITEM UNIT UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE 

NO. 

~~() Gabion Rock ­ 3' to 12' Open Per Ton No Bid 

i 21. 6"-0" Crushed -Jaw Run Per Ton 6.00 

22. 6"-0" Crushed Rock PerTon No Bid 

23. 6"-3" Crushed Rock PerTon i No Bid 

24. Bar Run PerTon 5.75 

25. Beach Sand Per Ton! No Bid 

No Bid 
, 

26. F'<lirllJ<lX~<l"cJ Per Ton I--------------­ ---------------­ ------------------------------------------------­

27. Fill Sand Per Ton 5.50 

28. Landscape Rock i Per Ton No Bid 

29. Loam I Per Ton 9.50 I I 
30 Machine Selected Rip Rap I Per Ton No Bid I I 
31. Non-Machine Selected Rip Rap PerTon No Bid 

Portland Cement Concrete - 3500 psi 
PerTon I32. 3/4" rock 10.00 

33. Quarry Pi! Run Per Ton I No Bid 
t ­

• DEVIATIONS NfA 

--------------­

ADDENDUMS i NIA 

I! 

PilOf; 1 R of 1 R 




